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The William Skinner Cooper
Award is given to honor an outstand-
ing recent contribution in geobotany,
physiographic ecology, plant succes-
sion, or the distribution of organisms
along environmental gradients. The
2001 Award goes to Thomas Swetnam
and Julio Betancourt for their paper
“Mesoscale disturbance and ecologi-
cal response to decadal climate vari-
ability in the American Southwest,”
published in 1998 in Journal of Cli-
mate. Both Swetnam, who is cur-
rently Director of the Laboratory of
Tree-Ring Research at the University
of Arizona, and Betancourt, who is a
scientist with the USGS at the Desert
Laboratory in Tucson, have worked
extensively on questions of long-term
variability in climate and disturbance
in the western United States. This pa-
per represents a synthesis of consid-
erable material, both original and
from other sources, combined with
new data and analyses.

WILLIAM S. COOPER

AWARD

Distinguished Service Citation is
particularly timely, as Lou Pitelka
retires this year from his highly suc-
cessful tenure as Editor.

Distinguished Service Citation
Subcommittee: Deborah E. Goldberg
(Chair), Robert Holt, Pamela
Matson, Bruce Menge, Judy Meyer,
Steven Pacala, C. Richard Tracy

Thomas Swetnam and Julio Betancourt

Swetnam and Betancourt present
data on fire history, insect outbreaks,
and climate variation over the last 400
years in the Southwest. They have
demonstrated the relationship of re-
gional wildfire patterns to the South-
ern Oscillation Index (SOI), and how
relative strength or weakness of the
SOI can govern the degree of regional
synchronicity and intensity of fire
disturbances. They have moved be-
yond presenting simple correlations
of climate and fire, instead showing
that the relationship between regional
climate and fire dynamics is com-
plex and temporally variable. They
have demonstrated, for example, the
importance of oscillating wet and dry,
El Niño–La Niña regimes for build-
ing fuel, then drying and igniting it
over large areas of the West.

They also document the large-
scale role of interannual and inter-
decadal climate variability in regional
drought episodes and insect out-
breaks. Previous work has empha-
sized the role of drought as a trigger
for insect outbreaks (the “stress hy-
pothesis”). Swetnam and Betancourt
conclude that although the drought-
stress hypothesis is supported for
bark-feeding insects, large-scale out-
breaks of foliage-feeding insects in
the western U.S. are triggered by wet
conditions, and the corresponding in-
crease in plant growth (and thus food
availability for insect herbivores). Fi-
nally, they present evidence that, in
addition to its role in disturbance re-
gimes, climate can also have persis-
tent, large-scale, direct impacts on

ecosystem structure and function. The
paper ends with a “call to arms” for
other ecologists to begin considering
how ecological processes play out on
large (regional) spatial scales and long
(decadal or greater) temporal scales.
Lamenting the lack of research that has
accompanied well-documented cli-
mate shifts in the last few decades,
Swetnam and Betancourt say these
“missed opportunities suggest that
ecologists should pay more attention
to mesoscale responses of ecosystems
to climate variability, and specific cli-
matic events, such as drought.”

There may be no other work that
captures the overriding climatic con-
trols on ecosystem dynamics over
both short and long time scales as
well as this paper does; for this qual-
ity it has earned the 2001 W. S.
Cooper Award.

Cooper Award Subcommittee:
Andrea Lloyd (Chair), Mark Bush,
Roger Del Moral, Marie Josée-Fortin,
Ronald Neilson, Ricardo Villalba,
Susan Will-Wolf

CORPORATE AWARD

Glen Dunsworth (left) and

William J. Beese (right),

Weyerhaeuser Corporation

British Columbia Coastal Group

The Corporate Award of the ESA
is made to recognize and honor a
company for accomplishments incor-
porating sound ecological concepts,
knowledge, and practices. It is given
in one of six categories. The award in
2001 is for stewardship of land re-
sources. The winner of the 2001
Corporate Award is Weyerhaeuser
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Madhav Gadgil

Honorary membership in the
Ecological Society of America is
awarded to individuals who have
made outstanding contributions to
the field of ecology and who live
and work outside of the U.S.,
Canada, and Mexico. The 2001 Hon-
orary ESA Member is Dr. Madhav
Gadgil, one of the best and most
prominent ecologists of our time. He
is arguably the most distinguished
ecologist in India, and is among the
finest ecologists in Asia. Both his
research and conservation interests
successfully blend community ecol-
ogy and human sociology as an un-
broken continuum. He has had a
profound effect on conservation in
India, not only through his own work,
but also by training many outstand-
ing young ecologists.

Madhav Gadgil is totally commit-
ted to solving environmental prob-
lems in the Third World by analyz-
ing issues carefully and applying
ecological theory. These themes are
discussed in two books, This Fissured
Land: An Ecological History of In-
dia, and Ecology and Equity: Use
and Abuse of Nature in Contempo-
rary India. These books are among
the best expressions of the dilemmas
of the equitable and sustainable use
of natural resources.

Originally a fish biologist when
he went to Harvard for his Ph.D,
Gadgil became interested in issues

HONORARY

MEMBERSHIP AWARD

Corporation British Columbia Coastal
Group and Forest Project Team, for
the conception of, commitment to,
and implementation of their “Forest
Project” approach to management.

Ecologists and staff of MacMillan
Bloedel Ltd., a large forest products
company operating in BC in the late
1990s, originated this new approach
to ecosystem management in 1997.
The Forest Project planning and stew-
ardship approach, led by the same in-
dividuals, has persisted through the
purchase of MacMillan Bloedel by
Weyerhaeuser in 1999. The Forest
Project allocates the land resource
base into three zones, each with a
unique mix of management objec-
tives and techniques: Timber, Habi-
tat, and Old Growth. Even in the
Timber zone, clear-cutting has been
eliminated and each zone is managed
with a distinct mix of partial cutting
systems. The shift from clear-cutting
to the silvicultural system of Variable
Retention (based on recommendations
from a scientific panel on sustainable
forestry practices) is being accom-
plished with an emphasis on em-
ployee safety and a corporate objec-
tive focused on economic margin
rather than absolute harvest volume.
The Forest Project Team has devel-
oped formal mechanisms for adaptive
management and for seeking feedback
and input from the scientific commu-
nity, including the organization of an-
nual reviews by a panel of external
evaluators from the scientific, environ-
mental, and corporate communities.
The Forest Project has also formed
notable partnerships, such as the cre-
ation of a new company, Iisaak Forest
Resources, with five First Nations in
the local area.

The Ecological Society of America
is very pleased to recognize these
efforts by presenting Glen Dunsworth,
Forest Renewal and Biodiversity Pro-
gram Leader, and Bill Beese, Forest
Ecologist, with the Corporate Award
for 2001.

Corporate Award Subcommittee:
Laura Foster Huenneke (Chair),
Gregory Aplet, Joan Ehrenfeld, Susan
Galatowitsch, Carolyn Hunsaker, Kate
Lajtha

of life history evolution and the role
of dispersal in population dynamics.
He co-authored an influential book
(M. Gadgil and W. H. Bossert. 1970,
Life History Consequences of Natural
Selection), and papers on selection of
optimal life histories for plants, and
on r and K theory.

After returning to India, he estab-
lished the Center for Ecological Sci-
ences at the Indian Institute of Sci-
ence, which is the premier ecological
research group in India. Research
through CES embraces an enormous
spectrum of topics, with students and
faculty working on nonlinear dynam-
ics, conservation biology, native
plant restoration, insect ecology, for-
est ecology, elephant behavior, and
ecology of native tribes. He has pub-
lished on conservation, animal ecol-
ogy, plant ecology, human ecology,
and economics of resources, agricul-
ture, and property rights. To each
problem studied, Gadgil brings a
fresh and usually novel insight,
firmly rooted in ecological theory.

No ecologist in India has as
much influence as Madhav Gadgil,
both through his voluminous writing
and his service as special counsel to
the Indian government. His member-
ship in several Academies of Science,
and his active participation in inter-
national organizations and commit-
tees on ecology and conservation,
also document his international stat-
ure and recognition.

Honorary Member Award Sub-
committee: Laurel R. Fox (Chair),
Edith Allen, James Coleman, Denise
Dearing, Richard Ostfeld, Sandra
Tartowski, Sally Woodin




